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2 Swallow Hill, THURLBY, BOURNE, Lincolnshire  PE10 0JB £550,000

***OFFERS ARE INVITED IN EXCESS OF £575,000 FOR THIS CHARACTER FIVE BEDROOM FAMILY HOME ON ONE OF THURLBY'S

MOST SOUGHT AFTER LOCATIONS WITH ANNEX POTENTIAL*** "Situated on 1/3 of an acre (approx.) this well maintained

character property has been modernised to a high standard whilst retaining a wealth of original features. Benefits from

kitchen/diner, lounge, family room, study, utility room, downstairs cloakroom, five bedrooms and family bathroom. Outside

the front provides off street parking for several vehicles leading to a double garage and a generous rear garden with field views.

EPC Rating D."
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ENTRANCE HALLWAY
Minton tiled flooring, under stairs storage
cupboard, stairs to first floor landing, radiator.

FAMILY ROOM
15' 9" x 13' 11" (4.80m x 4.24m) (approx.) Log
burner with feature surround, TV point, sealed unit
double glazed bay window to front aspect, two
radiators.

LOUNGE
16' x 13' (4.88m x 3.96m) (approx.) Sealed unit
double glazed bay window to front aspect, coal
effect gas fire with surround, wooden flooring, TV
point, radiator.

STUDY
13' x 12' (3.96m x 3.66m) (approx.) Door to
garden, radiator, wooden floor.

KITCHEN/DINER
18' 9" x 11' 4" (5.72m x 3.45m) (approx.) Fitted
with a range of base, drawer and wall mounted
units, 1 1/2 sink with mixer tap, solid wood
worktop, integral dishwasher, range cooker,
window to rear aspect, tiled floor, radiator.

DOWNSTAIRS CLOAKROOM
Fitted with a two piece suite comprising wash
hand basin, low level WC, tiled splash backs,
radiator.

REAR HALLWAY
Door to garden, UPVC double glazed French
doors.

BEDROOM FIVE (ANNEX POTENTIAL)
9' 9" x 6' 10" (2.97m x 2.08m) (approx.) Sealed
unit double glazed window to side aspect,
radiator.

STAIRS TO FIRST FLOOR LANDING

BEDROOM ONE
12' 9" x 13' 7" (3.89m x 4.14m) (approx.) Sealed
unit double glazed window to front aspect, double
radiator, feature fireplace.

BEDROOM TWO
12' 9" x 13' 3" (3.89m x 4.04m) (approx.) Sealed
unit double glazed window to front aspect, double
radiator, feature fireplace.

Property details herein do not form part or all of an offer or contract. Any measurements included are for guidance only and, as such, must not be used for the purchase of carpets or fitted furniture etc. We have not tested any

apparatus, equipment, fixtures or services; neither have we confirmed or verified the legal title of the property. All prospective purchasers must satisfy themselves as to the correctness and accuracy of such details provided by us.

We accept no liability for any existing or future defects relating to any property. Any plans shown are not to scale and are meant as a guide only.
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BEDROOM THREE
12' 9" x 11' 9" (3.89m x 3.58m) (approx.) Sealed
unit double glazed window to rear aspect,
radiator, exposed floorboards.

BEDROOM FOUR
12' 6" x 11' 9" (3.81m x 3.58m) (approx.) Sealed
unit double glazed window to rear aspect,
radiator, feature fireplace.

FAMILY BATHROOM
Fitted with a four piece suite comprising free
standing bath, shower cubicle, wash hand basin,
low level WC, tiled floor, extensive tiling, sealed
unit double glazed window to rear aspect.

OUTSIDE
The front is enclosed by hedging and mature
trees. There is a good size gravelled driveway
leading to the front and side for several vehicles
leading to a detached double garage. 
There is gated access to the side and rear
gardens.
The side garden is of a good size and mainly laid
to lawn and bordered by hedging and fruit trees,
access to rear garden.
The rear garden is low maintenance with a good
size patio and gravelled area with field views to
the rear, brick built shed.

DOUBLE GARAGE
With two up and over doors, power and light
connected.

AGENT NOTE
The vendor believes (subject to the necessary
planning permission being sought there is
potential to build).
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